From: Dino Beck [mailto:dino.beck@vermeermidatlantic.com]
Sent: Monday, January 23, 2017 10:48 AM

To: Metcalf, Kevin

Cc: 'Jeff Cronshaw'

Subject: RE: Revised NJPA Quote on Vermeer S800tx & Dozer Blade

Kevin, if you can use this email as price guarantee Thru February 2017. If not let me know and will get
updated NJPA quote

Equipment Advisor / Vermeer Mid Atlantic, Inc.

10900 Carpet St. | Charlotte, NC 28273
EQUIPPEDTO O: 704-588-3238 | M: 704-564-9937 | F: 704-588-8847
DOMORE. www.VermeerMA.com | dino.beck@vermeerma.com

From: Metcalf, Kevin [mailto:Kevin.Metcalf@mecklenburgcountync.gov]
Sent: Monday, January 23, 2017 10:31 AM

To: 'dino.beck@vermeermidatlantic.com'

Subject: RE: Revised NJPA Quote on Vermeer S800tx & Dozer Blade

Can we get a guaranteed price valid for more than the 30 days indicated on the quote? —
it would probably be around a February purchase.
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