Northwest Health Center

Bid Tabulation Certification
SOLItheaSt Health Center 1 he n dge that this is a true and of the bids received.

OWNER: Meck Co Govt - GOV
PREPARER: Meck Co Govt - AFM
PROJECT: Northwest & Southeast Health Centers — Roof Modifications Jery Russell - AFM PM 311812025
DATE: March 18, 2025 - 2:00 pm

Cenfcaeot | _Certicte of Roof | geceived i wartty - = o
Contractor Name RO Bid Bond BDI Form A | BDI Form B Non Compliance with Manufacturer's A BETBLTS Base Bid e Allowance No. 1 Total Bid Alternate No. 1 Add / Alternate No. 2 Add / Alternate No. 3 Add /

Discrimination Acknowledgement B
Deduct Deduct Deduct

Ej:s Realty, LLC ¢/o FAGC Construction, 125817 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $ 7,396,950.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 7,496,950.00 | $ - 0 NO BID 0 NO BID 0
Tecta America Carolinas LLC 60043 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $ 680,791.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 3,250.00 719,041.00 | $ 55,000.00 14 297,837.00 20 $  352,483.00 20
Interstate Roofing Company, Inc. 5841 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $ 525,800.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 564,800.00 | $ 15,000.00 10 200,000.00 0 NO BID 0
Rike Roofing Services, Inc. 73047 Y Y Y Y Y \ Y $ 625,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 655,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 20 229,000.00 a5 NO BID 0
Eskola, LLC 68103 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $ 758,605.56 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 808,605.56 | $ 75,000.00 20 285,414.13 20 $ 322,160.82 20

| hereby certify that this is a true tabulation of bids received.

Lriohband Britt-

Richard Britt
Project Manager




